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THE POLICE & CRIME COMMISSIONER FOR CLEVELAND 
 

DECISION RECORD FORM 
 
 

REQUEST: For Police & Crime Commissioner approval. 
 
 

Title: Police Property Act Funding  
 
 

Executive Summary:  
 
The PCC has funding available through the Police Property Act Fund (PPAF). Applicants are 
welcome via an ‘apply for funding’ section of the PCC website. Applications are reviewed on a 
regular basis, with the requirements for bids to link to the PCCs Police and Crime Plan. 
 
St Ann’s Partnership was founded in February 2006 by members of the local community to 
promote and facilitate works of regeneration, renewal and well-being for the local community.  
 
St Ann’s Partnership is a small charity that aims to provide, promote and develop projects, 
initiatives and opportunities that will alleviate disadvantage and poverty of all residents living in 
the St Ann’s area in Stockton-on-Tees. The vision is to build the capacity of and empower 
disadvantaged communities, groups and individuals, through the provision of resources and 
support and empowering residents to become stakeholders in their local communities by 
motivating and educating as well as maintaining a flexibility that allows generated demands and 
individual commitments to be met. We are based and work in partnership with The Willows 
Community Centre which is situated in the heart of the estates of Portrack and Tilery (part of 
the wider St Ann’s area). 
 
Funding will be used to host a community event aimed at children and young people from the 
area, with the aim of diverting them from antisocial behaviour. 
 
The below decision follows a review of an application received by the PCC.  
 
 

Decision:  
To approve the award of £400.00 to St Ann’s Partnership 
 
 

OPCC Lead Officer: Amanda Wilkinson 
 
 

Contractor Details (if applicable):  St. Ann’s Partnership (Charity Number 1141202) 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Decision Reference: 2022-0019 
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Implications:  

Has consideration been taken of the following: Yes No  

Financial    

Legal    

Equality & Diversity     

Human Rights    

Sustainability    

Risk    

(If yes please provide further details below) 

 
Decision Required – Supporting Information 
 
Financial Implications: (Must include comments of the PCC’s Chief Finance Officer where the 
decision has financial implications) 
 

Sufficient funding is available within the 2022/23 budget to be able to support this bid, which 
totals £400.00.  

 
Legal Implications: (Must include comments of the Monitoring Officer where the decision has 
legal implication)  
 

 

This funding is a donation for charitable purposes pursuant to the PCC's powers as 'relevant 
authority' as set out in the Police Property Act 1897. 

 
Equality and Diversity Implications: 
 

 

N/A 

 
Human Rights Implications: 
 

 

N/A 

 
Sustainability Implications: 
 

Property Act Fund allocations are one off funding allocations with bidders required to outline 
their sustainability plans as part of their application. 

 
Risk Management Implications:  
 

 

N/A 
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OFFICER APPROVAL 
 
Monitoring Officer: 
 
I have been consulted about the decision and confirm that financial, legal, and equalities advice 
has been taken into account. I am satisfied that this is an appropriate request to be submitted to 
the Police and Crime Commissioner.  
 
 

Signed  

  

Date 24/11/2022  

 

 

 
Police and Crime Commissioner: 
 
 

The above request HAS my approval.  
 
 

Signed 

 

Date 30/11/2022  

 

 


